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June 19, 2025

Tyler County

100 West Bluff Street
Woodyville, Texas 75979

Via Email: judge@co.tyler.tx.us

Attn: Hon. Milton Powers & Commissioners

RE: GLO CDBG REGIONAL MIT Road Improvements
Hurricane Harvey HUD MID
GLO Contract No. 24-065-047-E539

Judge and Commissioners:

On May 22, 2025, the County received construction bids from five (5) contractors for the
referenced project. A tabulation of bids is attached and summarized below:

Texas Crockett Pinto Apeck Lakey Inc
BIDDER / Materials Const - Const— | Const,LLC | "%~
PKG Group — Crockett, Nac, TX - Anacoco, X !
Jasper, TX X LA
Bid ; :::aag:g 1= | $1,2281134.36 | $1,244,561.50 | $1,553,838.51 | $1,336,818.00 | $2,045,626.00
*ﬂg ;23233;11 " | $366,833.08 | $421,614.00 | $419,534.56 | $370,973.00 | $499,374.00
o gockage - | $184,44275 | $192,10050 | $252,240.08 | $198,413.00 | $235,020.00
B,'\%Sft‘if,keagf;s' $204,554.89 | $237,953.00 | $294,650.64 | $236,539.00 | $290,667.00
B'dl';:::gg 2- | $1,888,303.40 | $2,503,124.00 | $2,257,008.12 | $2,108,349.00 | $2,818,970.00
BA‘;S;&';agfdzf $473,513.35 | $667,004.00 | $590,366.17 | $514,436.00 | $712,646.00
B'“g:::;%g 3= | $1,565,045.98 | $1,877,180.00 No Bid $1,755,059.50 | $2,546,226.00
BA‘;;‘:;'S%?f; $177,969.97 | $217,960.00 No Bid $208,644.50 | $291,080.00
Bﬂgﬁi‘f";agf d32' $69,451.76 $64,527.00 No Bid $66,460.00 $79,228.00
BA‘Z:;‘;"eagf d33' $121,285.00 | $145,631.00 No Bid $138,35.00 | $168,114.00
B/'\‘:l;i‘;';agie d34" $76,803.53 $75,103.50 No Bid $71,088.00 $90,702.00
B,'Sj:;;';agffs' $93,086.40 $93,353.50 No Bid $83,630.00 $103,900.00
B'dg :s":gﬁ‘j 4= | 13308523 | $190,873.00 No Bid $142,575.00 | $211,276.00
BA'%ESS%?:{ $110,682.18 | $133,500.00 No Bid $108,305.00 | $160,116.00
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| BidPackages | NoBid | $12200000 | NoBid | $184276.00 | $300,000.00 |

Bid package 1 — Base Bid is for the reconstruction of lvanhoe Dr and County Roads 1220 and
1325.

Bid package 1 - Additive Bid 1 is for the reconstruction of county road 4265.
Bid package 1 - Additive Bid 2 is for the reconstruction of county road 1060.
Bid package 1 - Additive Bid 3 is for the reconstruction of county road 1065.
Bid package 2 — Base Bid is for the reconstruction of County Roads 2200 and 2175.

Bid package 2 - Additive Bid 1 is for the reconstruction of additional footage on county road
2175.

Bid package 3 - Base Bid is for the reconstruction of County Roads 4005, 4020, 4025, 4070
and 4072.

Bid package 3 - Additive Bid 1 is for the reconstruction of additional footage on county road
4020.

Bid package 3 — Additive Bid 2 is for the reconstruction of county road 4073.

Bid package 3 - Additive Bid 3 is for the reconstruction of county road 4071.

Bid package 3 - Additive Bid 4 is for the reconstruction of county road 4074.

Bid package 3 - Additive Bid 5 is for the reconstruction of county road 4075.

Bid package 4 — Base Bid is for the reconstruction of County Road 4774.

Bid package 4 - Additive Bid 1 is for the reconstruction of additional footage county road 4774.

Bid package 5 is for the construction of an emergency backup generator at the ESD #7 in
Colmesneil.

When looking at the base bids 1 thru 4 and their respective additive bids for each package, the
Low Bid was received from Texas Materials East Texas Area for the bid packages. The low bid
for bid package 5 was received from Crockett Construction.

Based on the above statement, our extensive work history with the low bidders and after review
and discussion of the bids with the county, we put forth the following recommendation for action
by the court:
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Award bid package 1 base bid, additive bid 1, additive bid 2 and additive bid 3 in the
amount of $1,983,965.08 to the low bidder (Texas Materials East Texas Area).

Award bid package 2 base bid and additive bid 1 in the amount of $2,361,816.75 to the
low bidder (Texas Materials East Texas Area).

Award bid package 3 base bid, additive bid 1, additive bid 2, additive bid 3, additive bid 4
and additive bid 5 in the amount of $2,103,642.64 to the low bidder (Texas Materials East
Texas Area).

Award bid package 4 base bid and additive bid 1 in the amount of $244,667.41 to the low
bidder (Texas Materials East Texas Area).

Award bid package 5 in the amount of $122,000.00 to the low bidder (Crockett
Construction).

Grant funds available for construction = $7,597,532.00
Proposed award = $6,816,091.88
Grant funds remaining after award = $781,440.12

Sincerely, %

Nicholas Hoelscher, P.E.
Project Engineer

Cc:  Lesley Waxman, David J Waxman, Inc. (via email)

Susan Stover, David J Waxman, Inc. (via email)
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